
 

 
BA (Hons) Photography, ARPS 

7 Gent Close, Blandford Forum, Dorset, DT11 7NF 
 

TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF BUSINESS 
 
PAYMENT 
 
Half the cost of the wedding photography is payable on booking and the balance is payable one 
month prior to the event.  Full payment for all additional orders must be made with orders. 
 
OWNERSHIP OF PHOTOGRAPHS 
 
All photographs remain the property of A J Photographic and can only be reproduced with prior 
agreement.  Any misuse will be deemed to have breeched the copyright laws.  The 1988 
Copyright Act assigns copyright to the photographer.  It is contrary to the Act to copy or allow to 
be copied photographically, electronically or by any other means an image created as part of this 
contract, without permission of the photographer in writing. 
 
THE PHOTOGRAPHER 
 
On occasions and without notice it may be necessary for the photographer originally specified to 
be substituted by another photographer, (e.g. due to ill health). 
 
LICENCE 
 
The photographer/s shall be granted complete artistic licence including in relation to the poses 
photographed and the locations used, the photographer/s’ judgement regarding the 
locations/pose and number of images taken shall be final.  Due to the vagaries of the weather and 
the willingness of subjects it may not be possible to capture all the images requested. 
 
FORCE MAJEURE OR ACT OF GOD 
 
The due performance of this contract is subject to alteration or cancellation by either party owing 
to any cause beyond their control. 
 
DISPLAY 
 
The client hereby allows the photographer/s to display any images included in this contract in their 
studios, portfolios, literature, wedding, exhibitions and advertising.  No use of the images will be 
made by the photographer/s for other commercial reason except with the written permission of the 
client. 
 
CANCELLATION 
 
The client may cancel this contract at any time by giving written notice to the photographer/s but 
in doing so shall forfeit any monies paid.   Initial Bride ………………        Initial Groom ……………. 
 
 
 
 
 



 
LIMITATION OF LIABILITY 
 
In the unlikely event that of total failure or cancellation of the contract by either party, the liability 
of one party to the other party shall be limited to the total value of the contract.  Neither party shall 
be liable for indirect or consequential loss. 
 
SPECIAL REQUESTS 
 
Every effort will be made to complete special requests but theses are not a binding instruction. 
 
COMPLAINTS 
 
Any complaints must be made in writing within 3 days of receipt of albums, orders, etc.  Every 
effort will be made to resolve the matter to your satisfaction. 
 
I/WE HAVE READ THIS CONTRACT AND AGREE TO ABIDE BY THE TERMS AND 
CONDITIONS OF BUSINESS.  I/WE UNDERSTAND THAT THE TERMS OF THIS AGREEMENT 
CANNOT BE CHANGED UNLESS AGREED BY BOTH PARTIES IN WRITING. 
 
BRIDE’S FORENAME ………………………… GROOM’S FORENAME ………………………… 
 
KNOWN AS …………………………………… KNOWN AS ……………………………………… 
 
BRIDE’S SURNAME …………………………. GROOM’S SURNAME ………………………….. 
 
SIGNATURE BRIDE ………………………… SIGNATURE GROOM ………………………….. 
 
SIGNATURE DATE ………………………….. SIGNATURE DATE …………………………….. 
 
PACKAGE BOOKED ……………………………………………………………..…………………… 
 
PHOTOGRAPHERS REQUIRED   TWO 
 
EVENT TYPE  ………………………………… EVENT DATE ………………………………..….. 
  
CEREMONY VENUE   ……………………………………………………………..…………………… 
 
RECEPTION VENUE ………...………………………………………………………………………….  
 
HOME ADDRESS ………...…………………………………………………………………………….. 
 
BRIDE’S MOBILE TEL NO ………..……………………………………………………………………  
 
GROOM’S MOBILE TEL NO …….……………………………………………………....……………. 
 
HOME TELEPHONE NO …….…………………………………………………………………………  
  
GROOM’S EMAIL ADDRESS ………………………………………………………...………………… 
 
BRIDE’S EMAIL ADDRESS ………………………………………………………...………………… 
 
 
PAYMENT MUST BE RECEIVED FOR BEFORE SHIPMENT OF ORDERS 
© A J Photographic 2006 


